
Research Note 

 

The Fiqh of Balance 
A type of understanding we need 

I have dealt with the type of fiqh we need, or at least with some of 

them, on various occasions. A part of my argument is included in 

my book 'The Islamic awakening Between Ingratitude and 

Extremism': dealing with the fiqh of practices and the fiqh of ranks 

of deeds. Another part of the argument is included in my book 

"The Islamic Awakening Between Permitted Difference and 

Undesirable Disunity", dealing with one of the main types of fiqh 
we need; the fiqh of difference.  

By the Fiqh of Balances we mean several matters as follows: 

1. Balancing intersects against each other, in terms of size and 

capacity; value and effect; as well as endurance. So as to 

determine which should be given precedence and which should 

be discarded. 

2. Balancing evils against each other in the same way of balancing 

interests, so as to determine which could be accepted and which 

has to be avoided. 

3. Balancing interests against evils if they contradict. So as to 

determine when to give the avoidance of evil a precedence over 

the gaining of interests and when to forgive evil for the sake of 

interests.  

The need for two levels of fiqh : 

In this respect, we need two levels of Fiqh as follows: 

The need for two fiqh of Sharia:  

The first of these levels is a Sharia fiqh based on a profound 

understanding of the letter and spirit of Sharia, so as to establish 

the soundness of the said "principle of balances" and determine its 

evidence. Which should be clear to those who endeavor to 

understand the judgments and texts of Sharia and delve deep in  

its secrets. 
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Shariah was sent down only for achieving benefits for human in 
earthly life and in the hereafter. In the known ranks of those 
interests: Al-Daruriyyah (the indispensable), Al-Hajiyyah  (the 
needful) and Al-Tahsiniyyah (the dignifying)  

The need for the Fiqh of Factual Experience:  

The second level is a rather positivistic Fiqh based on the study of 
contemporary reality - a study that is careful, comprehensive and 
dependent on the most accurate information and statistic. However, 
we have to warn here against misleading and unrealistic figures 
based on propaganda leaflets, inadequate information and 
questionnaires aimed at serving a specific objective, not at serving 
truth as a whole.  

Integration of the Two Types of Fiqh in Examining Interests and 
Evils:  

Both the Fiqh of Sharia and Fiqh of Factual experience should be 
integrated so that we may reach the proper academic balancing 
process that is free from both extremism and neglect.  

The sharia aspect here is clear in principal. It was discussed in the 
books of Usul al Fiqh (Principles of Jurisprudence). Starting with 
'Al-Mustafa' and up to 'Al-Muwafaqaf, as well as the books on 
rules, similarities and differences.  

When interests conflict, lower interest is sacrificed for the sake of 
higher interest, and private interest is sacrificed for the sake of 
common interest, and the owner of private interest is to be 
compensated for his loss. Also in cases of conflicting interests, 
temporary interest is forsaken in favor of long term or permanent 
interest; superficial interest is neglected for the sake of real 
interest, and sure interest is given precedence over uncertain 
interest. In the Treaty of Hudaibia, the Prophet (SM) gave 
prominence to real, basic and future interests over some 
considerations that others would never have relinquished. He 
agreed such conditions that at first glance seemed unfair or 
humiliating to Muslims; he agreed to the removal of the phrase "In 
the name of Allah, Most Merciful, Most Compassionate", in whose 
place was written "In The name of God". He also agreed not to be 
mentioned as the Messenger of Allah in the pact, and to write his 
name only as Mohammad Ibn Abdullah. The examples are many. 
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If evils conflict, and some of are indispensable, than one should 
choose the lesser of two evils and the lower of two degrees of 
harm prescribed.  

Muslim scholars have prescribed that harm should be eliminated 
as much as possible and that a lesser harm should not be 
eliminated with a greater harm. A minor harm should be tolerated 
if such tolerance would make it possible to avoid a major harm, 
and private harm should be accepted for the sake of avoiding 
common harm.  

Many examples of this are mentioned in books on the 'rules of 
Fiqh' or 'similarities and analogies'.  

If interests and evils conflict, they should be examined carefully in 
terms of their size, effect and duration.  

A slight evil should be forgiven for the sake of realizing a major 
interest.  

A temporary evil should be forgiven for the sake of realizing a 
long-term or permanent interest.  

Even a great evil should be accepted if its elimination would lead 
to a greater evil.  

In normal conditions, the avoidance of evil should come before 
the realization of interest.  

It is not enough that we should accept this concept in theory, but 
rather we have to apply it in practice, for many of the differences 
among the active Islamist groups are related to these balances.  

Is alliance with non-Muslim forces acceptable? 

Is reconciliation or pacification with governments that do not 
adhere to Islam acceptable?  

Is it allowed participating in a ruling regime that is not purely 
Islamic and operates under a constitution that has loopholes or 
does not have our full approval?  

Should we establish Islamic economic institutions in an 
environment dominated by usury-based, man-made economic 
system?  

Should we allow Muslim elements to work for usury based banks 
and establishments. or should we keep all the religious elements 
that adhere to the teachings of Islam away from such 
establishments? 
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The difficulty of practice in Real Life: 

It is easy to lay down a principal, but difficult to practice it. The 

fiqh of balances is not easy to grasp by layman and others who can 

raise a hue and cry for the slightest cause.  

The erudite scholar, Mawdudi, and his followers met much 

resistance and embarrassment when he, in the light of the fiqh of 

balances, was of the opinion that electing 'Fatima Jinnah' was less 

harmful than electing 'Ayub Khan'. They became a target of a 

ferocious campaign invoking the Hadith - 'A people who appoint a 

woman to lead them will never thrive'. So how about a people, 

who appoint their leader a tyrant, would they do any better? Never! 

The fiqh (of balances) here examines the two evils to choose the 

lesser one and avoid the greater of them.  

Dr. Hasan Al Turabi and his brothers in Sudan were attacked by 

some Islamists because they had to join the Socialist Union and 

had accepted some government appointments under Jafar Nimeiri's 

regime, even before he announced the application of Islamic Sharia 
in Sudan.  

Our brothers in Syria feared the same (opposition) when they 

decided to ally themselves with some non-Islamic forces to resist 

the regime that was seeking to annihilate them, although Prophet 

Mohammad (SM) allied himself with the tribe of Khuza who were 

polytheists, and he sought the support of one polytheists group 

against the other at times, too.  

However, I am not taking sides here. I am only advocating a 

principle: The Fiqh of balance, on which the structure of the 

"Sharia politics" should be built.  

In positions taken by the Prophet (SM) and his companions and in 

the provisions of our comprehensive Sharia is much evidence 

supporting this argument; that it is permissible to participate in a 

non-Islamic rule or ally with non-Muslim forces.  

Allama Yusuf Al-Qardawi 

Deen, Faculty of Shariah 

Qatar Islamic University 
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